
XtraNormal Directions 
 
1.  Ready to try it?  First thing you’ll need to do is sign up for an account.  Go to 
the website www.xtranormal.com and click “Sign Up” on the top right corner of 
your screen. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
3.  Complete the form to create an account. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
4. Check your email for instructions on how to activate your account. Click on the 
link in your email message to get to Xtranormal. 



 
 
5. Click “Log in.” Sign in to your account with the username and password you 
created. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

6.  Click “Make Movies” at the top of the screen.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



7.  Choose a setting/world for your movie to take place.  You can choose 1 or two 
actors. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
8.  Design your scene.  Choose a set, soundtrack, actors, and the actor’s voice. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
9.  When you’ve found the set you like, click “Apply.” 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



10.  Choose ambience (background noise) and/or music.  It may be best to pick 
one or the other since your character will be talking as well.  When you have 
made your selection, click “Apply.” 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
9.  Select your character and you can choose different voices for your character.  
Click the play button to preview the voice.  When you have made your character 
and voice selection, click “Apply.” 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 



10.  Type your character’s lines in a script block.  To make a new script block, 
click the + sign. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
11.  Anytime you make changes, and you’d like to see and hear your movie, click 
the blue “ACTION” button on the bottom right corner of the screen.  This takes a 
minute to load, but when it’s ready then you can click play to see your movie!  
Notice the “Take 5” button at the bottom of the screen.  You can always save 
your movie and come back to it later.   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
12.  You can drag camera angles, actions for your characters, and sound effects 
into your script.  Just click on the picture and drag it over to your script.   
 

13.  For example, drag this picture    to the end of your sentence in the 
script block.  A menu will appear and you can now choose an action for your 
character.  Push the play button to see what the action will look like.  When you 
have selected an action, click “Apply.” 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



14.  Now that you have selected your action, your character will do this action in 
the movie.  For example, I selected “Hands on hips.”  When my character is 
finished reading the line in the script, she will put her hands on her hips.  You can 
move the little pictures around in your script to change the timing.  For example, 
if I moved the action to the beginning of the sentence, my character would put 
her hands on her hips before reading the line.   
 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
15. You can use the same technique of dragging any of the icons below into your 
script.    Remember, at any time you can preview your movie by clicking the blue 
“Action” button.   

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
- Change the camera angle 
 
- Choose an action for your actor 
 
- Choose an expression for your character to make 
 
- Choose the direction your character looks 
 
- Have your character point 
 
 
- Insert pauses in the script 
 
- Add sound effects  
 

 
 



16.  When you are finished with your movie click “It’s a wrap.”  Notice the “Quick 
Tips” button to help you along the way.   
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
17.  Give your video a title, description, and rating.  When you have filled out the 
form, click “publish.” 
 

 
 
18.  You can find your completed movie under the “My Movies” tab at the top of 
the screen.  You can choose to share your movie by clicking the “Share” button 
at the bottom of the screen.  This will generate an email you can send with the 
link to your movie in the email.  XtraNormal also provides the URL to your video 
that can be copy and pasted.  You will need to copy and paste the URL for the 
movie you created in order to submit your form and receive your next password.  
For directions how to copy and paste the URL to the website, follow along below 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
19.   

 
 
Use your mouse to highlight the URL as shown below.  Right click where you  
have highlighted and select “Copy.” 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
20. Go back to our website www.4aplus.com/dninduction   Click on step 2 for 
XtraNormal.  Right click on the form where it says “Video URL” and select 
“Paste.”  The URL from your movie should show up.  Fill out the rest of the form 
and click “Submit.”  After submitting the form, contact the Now Channel for your 
username and password.  When you click launch you will see all the ways you 
can contact the Now Channel. Remember if at any time you need assistance, 
click on the space station to contact the NOW channel.  


